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2023 MEDINA COUNTY AGGREGATE BID ALL BIDDERS HAD REQUIRED DOCUMENTS AND CERTIFIED CHECKS                               EXHIBIT A

Bid Opening: December 15, 2022 @ 1:30 p.m.

6100 Wedgewood Road, Medina, OH

Osborne Medina, Inc Albrecht Trucking Shelly Materials Inc. Schemrich Bros. Building Sup. LLC

BID TAB 795 N. Progress Drive 6809 Spencer Lake Road 8920 Canyon Falls Blvd., Suite 120 2881 W. 130th Street

Medina, OH 44256 Medina, OH 44256 Twinsburg, OH 44087 Hinckley, OH 44233

330-723-0015 330-725-5161 330-405-5187 330-722-0981

QUANTITY
DESCRIPTION

LIMESTONE

#1 & #2 and/or #4 Crushed Limestone
703.01 #1&#2

$23.45 $29.60 $27.45 $27.45 $25.50 $31.80 $27.45 $28.45

703.01 #4
$23.45 $29.60 $27.45 $27.45 $25.65 $31.95 $27.45 $28.45

#8 and/or #9 Limestone
703.01 #8

$21.76 $27.62 $30.00 $30.00 $27.50 $33.80 $30.25 $31.25

703.01 #9
No Bid No Bid $26.70 $26.70 $21.85 $28.15 $26.15 $27.15

#8 and/or #9 Washed Limestone
703.01 #8 Washed

No Bid No Bid $30.00 $30.00 $27.50 $33.80 $30.25 $31.25

703.01 #9 Washed
$21.90 $27.52 $26.70 $26.70 $21.85 $28.15 $26.15 $27.15

#57 and/or #67 Crushed Limestone
703.01 #57

$21.21 $27.04 $29.50 $29.50 $26.15 $32.45 $28.80 $29.80

703.01 #67
No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.75 $26.15 $32.45 No Bid No Bid

411, 617, or 304 Crushed Limestone
703.01 #411

$20.35 $26.10 $25.65 $25.65 $20.95 $27.25 $25.10 $26.10

703.01 #617
$20.35 $26.10 No Bid No Bid $21.95 $28.25 No Bid No Bid

703.01 #304
$18.47 $24.14 $25.30 $25.30 $19.75 $26.05 $25.10 $26.10

QUANTITY
DESCRIPTION

GRAVEL

411, 617, or 304 Crushed Gravel
703.01 #411

No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

703.01 #617
No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

703.01 #304
No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ODOT 
SPEC

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

Up to  
1,500 tons

Up to   
1,500 tons

Up to  
1,500 tons

Up to  
1,500 tons

Up to  
2,500 tons

ODOT 
SPEC

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

Up to  
2,000 tons
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2023 MEDINA COUNTY AGGREGATE BID Osborne Medina, Inc Albrecht Trucking Shelly Materials Inc. Schemrich Bros. Building Sup. LLC

Bid Opening: December 15, 2022 @ 1:30 p.m. 795 N. Progress Drive 6809 Spencer Lake Road 8920 Canyon Falls Blvd., Suite 120 2881 W. 130th Street

6100 Wedgewood Road, Medina, OH Medina, OH 44256 Medina, OH 44256 Twinsburg, OH 44087 Hinckley, OH 44233

330-723-0015 330-725-5161 330-405-5187 330-722-0981

QUANTITY
DESCRIPTION

UNSPECIFIED MATERIAL TYPE

Fine Aggregate
703.01

$18.45 $23.87 No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

QUANTITY

#8 Air-Cooled Blast Furnace Slag
703.01 #8

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.00 $41.45 No Bid No Bid

#67 Air-Cooled Blast Furnace Slag
703.01 #67

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#57 Air-Cooled Blast Furnace Slag
703.01 #57

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.70 $29.15 No Bid No Bid

QUANTITY

703.19 Type A No Bid Solicited
$70.25

No Bid Solicited
$63.00

No Bid Solicited
No Bid

No Bid Solicited
No Bid

Dump Rock Type B Limestone
703.19 Type B No Bid Solicited

$65.25
No Bid Solicited

$60.00
No Bid Solicited

No Bid
No Bid Solicited

$58.60Only delivered dump rock may be bid;

Dump Rock Type C Limestone
703.19 Type C No Bid Solicited

$46.95
No Bid Solicited

$47.25
No Bid Solicited

No Bid
No Bid Solicited

$46.00Only delivered dump rock may be bid;

Dump Rock Type D Limestone
703.19 Type D No Bid Solicited

$42.75
No Bid Solicited

$43.25
No Bid Solicited

No Bid
No Bid Solicited

$40.50Only delivered dump rock may be bid;

4 X 8 Limestone
703.19 4 X 8

No Bid $42.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.50 $40.50Picked up 4 X 8 Limestone may be bid;

ODOT 
SPEC

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

Up to  
1,000 tons

                DESCRIPTION                    
AIR-COOLED BLAST FURNACE SLAG 

ODOT 
SPEC

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

Up to  
3,000 tons

Up to  
1,000 tons

Up to  
1,500 tons

                DESCRIPTION                    
LIMESTONE DUMP ROCK

ODOT 
SPEC

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

FOB PLANT 
UNIT PRICE

DELIVERED 
UNIT PRICE

    Up to     
750 tons

Dump Rock Type A Limestone               
Only delivered dump rock may be bid

    Up to     
750 tons

    Up to     
750 tons

    Up to     
750 tons

    Up to     
750 tons
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